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Collated Responses from NZ Political Party’s to NZHT Questionnaire – August 2005 
 
 
 

NZHT Questions Act New 
Zealand  

Green  
 

NZ First  
 

Maori  
 

National  
 

Progressive United
Future 

Labour  

Q1.  Does ((the party)) 
recognize the important role of 
natural health products in New 
Zealand? 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
No final policy but in principle 

YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q2.  Does ((the party)) agree 
that good nutrition is a major 
factor in preventing and 
mitigating illness & disease?  

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
No final policy but in principle 

YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q3.  Is ((the party)) committed 
to preserving New Zealander’s 
right to access a wide range of 
effective dietary supplements at 
a reasonable price?  

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
No final policy but in principle 

YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q4.  Does ((the party)) support 
the unanimous recommendations 
of the Health Select Committee 
report into the proposed Joint 
Trans Tasman Therapeutic 
Goods Agency? 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

National supported the Health 
Select Committee report 

 
Click here 
for letter 
attached 

 

 
YES 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q5.  Does ((the party)) intend to 
support the proposed Joint Trans 
Tasman Therapeutic Goods 
Agency? 

 
NO 

 
NO 

 
NO 

 
NO 

 
See comments in Q6 

 
See Q4 

 
Click here 
for letter 
attached 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q6.  Are there any 
circumstances in which ((the 
party)) would support the 
proposed Trans Tasman 
Therapeutic Goods Agency  

NO 
Not as 
things stand 
at the 
moment. 

NO  NO
The public must be 
informed of the benefits 
of this agency and support 
the changes before we 
would begin to consider 
the other issues of this 
JTA that concern 
NZ First. 

NO 
It is important 
that safety 
processes and 
regulations are 
developed by 
and for New 
Zealand 

YES 
National has made it clear that 
we would only support the 
proposed Trans Tasman 
Therapeutic Goods Agency 
when we are satisfied that New 
Zealand businesses, small, 
medium and large are not 
disadvantaged relative to 
Australian, and that compliance 
costs are cut to a minimum. 

 
 
 
 

See Q4 

 
 
 
 

See Q5 

 
 
 
 
Did not 
respond 
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Q7.  Does ((the party)) support 
New Zealand controlled 
regulation of dietary 
supplements, designed 
specifically for that industry? 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
We have no specific policy on 
this issue. 

 
See Q4 

 
See Q6 

 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q8.  Will ((the party)) 
endeavour to protect SME’s 
from unnecessary bureaucracy 
and compliance costs where 
there is no actual risk profile 
justifying such costs?  

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
See Q6 

 
 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q9.  Should New Zealanders be 
encouraged to take greater 
responsibility for their own 
health based on better education 
and information? 
 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
Did not 
respond 

Q10.  As long as Dietary 
supplements are prepared 
appropriately and properly 
labelled, should consumers be 
able to make their own choices? 
 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
YES 

 
In principle  

YES 
 

 
YES 

 
See Q6 

 

 
Did not 
respond 
 

Other Comments:     In replying to these questions, it 
is important to emphasize the 
‘National Party’ is committed to 
health promotion and disease 
prevention.  For many of these 
questions there is no formal 
policy. 

   

Questionnaire completed by: Heather Roy Sue 
Kedgley 

Barbara Stewart Not known Dr Paul Hutchison Jim 
Anderton 

Judy Turner  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 


